
Rheumatology Fellows 

Class of 2025 

Scott Goldberg, MD 

A native of New Jersey, Dr. Goldberg studied modern European history at 
Brown University and spent several years in public radio at WNYC in New 
York, including working on their science show Radiolab. He attended 
medical school at the University of Chicago Pritzker School of Medicine 
and completed his residency in internal medicine at the University of 
California at San Francisco. He spent several years as a primary care 
community health physician in the Bronx at Montefiore Medical Center 
before joining our fellowship. 

Mary Guan, MD 

Dr. Guan grew up in Ithaca, New York and Ann Arbor, Michigan, where she 
was a high school Intel Science Semifinalist. She attended college at MIT 
in Boston, majoring in biology and completed medical school at the 
University of Michigan. She spent an extra year during medical school as 
a Howard Hughes Medical Institute Medical Research Fellow and 
subsequently spent several years studying chronic hepatitis B patients in 
China. Prior to fellowship Dr. Guan completed her training in internal 
medicine at NYU, in our Community Medicine track, followed by a year 
serving as Chief Resident for the program. 

Emily Gutowski, MD 

A native of New Jersey, Dr. Gutowski studied Cell Biology and 
Neuroscience at Rutgers University. While at Rutgers she summered at 
Cambridge University in England where she studied Neuroscience, Ethics 
and Philosophy. She attended medical school at Harvard University, 
where she created a popular medical education podcast and conducted 
medical research. Prior to fellowship Dr. Gutowski completed her internal 
medicine training at Mt. Sinai School of Medicine, where she also studied 
the safety of checkpoint inhibitor cancer therapies in patients with 
rheumatic diseases. 
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Joshua Novack, MD 

A native of Westchester, Dr. Novack studied Molecular and Cell Biology as an 

undergraduate at Johns Hopkins, where his studies on connective tissue 
earned him the the Johns Hopkins University Provost Undergraduate 
Research Award. He attended medical school at NYU where he conducted 
research on lipid metabolism in mice, as well as solute transport in the 
kidney. Dr. Novack stayed at NYU for his internal medicine residency and 
studied bone microarchitecture in lupus patients before joining our 
fellowship. 
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Abhimanyu Amarnani, MD, PhD 

Dr. Amarnani, who is originally from Los Angeles, received his bachelor's 
degree from the University of California, Los Angeles. After coming east to 
attend medical school at SUNY Downstate College of Medicine in Brooklyn, 

he returned to Los Angeles for residency at the University of Southern 

California. Dr. Amarnani then transferred to NYU on the research pathway. 
His research has focused on lupus nephritis proteomics and B-cell 

transcription factor biology. 

Catherine Howe, MD 

Dr. Howe was born in New York City and raised in the suburbs with her three 

younger siblings. She studied neuroscience as an undergraduate at 
Fordham University, spending her summers doing research in 
electrophysiology at Albert Einstein School of Medicine and cell biology at 
Fordham. A graduate of Tufts School of Medicine, she attended Duke 
University for her residency and completed research in health literacy and 
telehealth utility. 

Nicole Leung, MD 

Dr. Leung was born and raised in New York City and attended Stuyvesant 
High School. She graduated from Duke University and remained there for 
medical school where she developed an interest in autoimmune connective 
tissue diseases and investigated systemic sclerosis. Dr. Leung returned to 

New York for residency training at NYU. As a resident she received a grant 
from the Rheumatology Research Foundation to conduct research in gout 

and complete coursework in clinical research design, biostatistics, and 
bioinformatics. 
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Cristina Sorrento, MD 

Dr. Sorrento is originally from Long Island and studied biochemistry as an 
undergraduate at Columbia University. Following graduation, she remained 
at Columbia for one year to perform research in chemistry and participate in 
chemistry education. She attended SUNY Downstate College of Medicine, 
where she was elected president of the downstate chapter of the Alpha 
Omega Alpha Honor Society. Dr. Sorrento went on to residency at Beth 
Israel Deaconess Medical Center in Boston. Her research interests include 
rheumatoid arthritis and cardiovascular disease, as well as osteoarthritis 
and frailty in the geriatric population. 
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Recent Alumni Listing Here 

Class of 2023 
Tasneem Ahmed, MD 

Meghan Anderson, DO, Chief Fellow 

Kelly Corbitt, DO 

Jammie Law, MD 

Class of 2022 

Brittany Banbury, MBBS 

Ghadeer Hasan, MD, MPH 

Gary H. Ho, MD 

Sara E. Stream, MD Chief Fellow 

Class of 2021 

Rebecca B. Blank, MD, PhD 

Robert Freilich, MD, PhD 

Allison Guttmann, MD, Chief Fellow 

Mayce Haj-Ali, MD 

Ben Plotz, MD 
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